

Law Offices of Edward Nusbaum P.C.

212 Post Road West
Westport, CT 06880-3239
(203)226-8181

Karen Riordan
51 Trolley Road
Guilford, CT 06437

Date: June 1, 2020

Invoice: 27784

Matter: 3070

Re: Karen Riordan v. Christopher Ambrose

Fees

Date	Description	Attorney	Hours	Amount
05-01-20	Text message exchange with client; telephone calls from client (3)	EN	0.50	375.00
	Text message exchange with client	EN	0.50	375.00
	Text message exchange with client	EN	0.10	75.00
05-02-20	Text message exchanges with client (4)	EN	0.60	450.00
05-04-20	Telephone call from client; e-mail to client; text message exchanges with client	EN	0.50	375.00
05-05-20	E-mail to client; review of e-mails from client; telephone call to Attorney Richard Callahan; review of e-mails re Dr. Biren Caverly/visitation	EN	1.00	750.00
05-06-20	Telephone call from Attorney Richard Callahan; telephone call to client	EN	0.30	225.00
05-07-20	Review of e-mail from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone calls to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz (2); telephone call from Attorney Richard Callahan	EN	1.00	750.00

	Telephone call to client; text message exchange with client	EN	0.40	300.00
	File in-lieu-of appearance with the Clerk of the Court; e-mail to counsel of record; e-mail to client	MLL	0.20	55.00
05-08-20	Review of e-mails from client; prepare in-lieu-of appearances; office conference with Attorney Richard Callahan and Attorney William RJP Brown; go over files with Attorney Richard Callahan; telephone call to client	EN	5.70	4,275.00
	Telephone call from Attorney Aidan Welsh; text message exchange with client; review of e-mail from client; e-mails to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.50	375.00
	Telephone call to client; review of text messages from client (2) and text message to client; review of additional text message exchanges of client	EN	0.30	225.00
	Intake of electronic files from Atty. Callahan; prepare case spreadsheet forms and financial affidavit form	HWH	0.50	350.00
05-09-20	Review of text message exchange	EN	0.10	75.00
05-10-20	Review of text message exchanges (12)	EN	0.30	225.00
05-11-20	E-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich; text message exchange with client; review of client's e-mail to Attorney Richard Callahan; review of text message exchange between client and husband	EN	0.50	375.00
	Review of bill of Jocelyn Hurwitz/GAL; e-mail to client; review of text messages; telephone call to Attorney William RJP Brown; telephone call to client	EN	0.80	600.00
	Review of file from Dr. Biren Caverly, including report; e-mails to counsel of record setting up Zoom meeting; multiple e-mails from Attorney William RJP Brown; e-mails to Attorney William RJP Brown; review of client's e-mail to Dr. Horwitz; review of e-mail from Jamie L. DeSantis, EdM, J.D.	EN	4.60	3,450.00

	Order via fax three transcripts from the Chief Reporter at the Bridgeport Superior Court/Court Reporter's Office	MLL	0.30	82.50
05-12-20	Zoom meeting with Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call from Dr. Coffey; telephone call to client; telephone call to Attorney William RJP Brown; review of multiple e-mails from client	EN	2.50	1,875.00
	Telephone call to client; telephone call from Michelle Paulino; review of e-mail from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone call to client; e-mails to/from Dr. Linda Smith	EN	0.70	525.00
05-13-20	Telephone call from Michelle Paulino; text message exchanges with client; telephone call to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of e-mail; listen to audio from client; review of text message of client re Mia; review of text message to client from Chris	EN	1.30	975.00
	Review of e-mail re Mia's panic attacks; e-mails to Dr. Linda Smith (2); telephone call to Dr. Coffey; review of JDNO Notice from Court; telephone call from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; text message exchanges with client	EN	1.30	975.00
05-14-20	Review of Chris Ambrose's e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of multiple e-mails from client; telephone call from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call from Dr. Coffey; text message exchange with client	EN	1.40	1,050.00
	Review of e-mails; telephone call to Attorney Aidan Welsh; review of e-mails; review of motion for contempt	EN	0.50	375.00
05-15-20	Review of e-mail from Bob Riordan; review of texts from Michelle; review of e-mails from Jami L. DeSantis, EdM, J.D.; e-mail to Dr. Linda Smith; telephone call to Dr. Horwitz; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call to client	EN	1.80	1,350.00
05-18-20	Review of e-mail from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn	EN	1.30	975.00

Hurwitz; intra-office conference with Attorney Haldeman

	Review of marital summary; e-mails to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of text messages; multiple telephone calls with client; multiple e-mail exchanges with client	EN	4.50	3,375.00
05-19-20	Review of marital summary; telephone call to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	1.80	1,350.00
	Multiple e-mails to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of text messages from client; telephone call to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.60	450.00
05-20-20	E-mail to client; multiple telephone calls to client; review of documents, in addition to marital summary; review of e-mails from client (7); conference call with Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	1.60	1,200.00
	Telephone call from Michelle Paulina; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; text message to client; telephone calls from client; review of e-mail from client; e-mails to client (2);	EN	1.30	975.00
	Review of e-mail from client re rent check; text message exchanges with client (13); e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.70	525.00
05-21-20	E-mails to Attorney Nancy Aldrich (2); review of e-mails from client (8); e-mail to client; review of e-mail from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	1.00	750.00
05-26-20	E-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.20	150.00
	E-mails to Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz (3); e-mail to client; review of multiple e-mails from Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.60	450.00
05-27-20	Review of multiple e-mails from client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	1.40	1,050.00

	Correspondence to client; telephone call to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of e-mail from client's father	EN	0.40	300.00
05-28-20	Telephone calls to/from client; review of e-mails from client (4); review of e-mail from Bob Riordan; e-mails to Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone calls from Bob Riordan	EN	1.00	750.00
	Telephone calls from client; e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of e-mail from client; telephone call from Bob Riordan; review of e-mail from Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	1.00	750.00
05-29-20	E-mails to/from Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz re conference call; review of e-mails from client; telephone calls to client; review of multiple e-mails between Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and the Family Caseflow Coordinator (Judge Grossman's Clerk); e-mails to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich re remote status conference	EN	2.10	1,575.00
	E-mail from client; e-mail to client	MLL	0.20	55.00
05-30-20	Telephone call to client	EN	0.20	150.00
				<hr/>
	Total Fees		48.10	\$35,717.50

Disbursements

Date	Description	Amount
05-12-20	Expense Recovery Wells Fargo Retainer Incoming Wire Fees on 5/6/20 & 5/7/20	30.00
05-28-20	Expense Recovery Wells Fargo Retainer Incoming Wire Fee on 5/28/20	15.00

Total Disbursements	\$45.00
Total Fees and Disbursements this billing period	\$35,762.50
Balance Forward at beginning of billing period	\$4,800.00
<i>Less: Payments received during this billing period to date of this invoice</i>	<i>\$33,400.00</i>
Interest Accrued on Past Due Amounts	\$0.00
<i>Less: Paid from your Retainer Account</i>	<i>\$28,600.00</i>
Total Amount Due for this billing period	\$7,162.50
Amount Remaining in your Client Retainer Account	\$0.00

Law Offices of Edward Nusbaum P.C.

212 Post Road West
Westport, CT 06880-3239
(203)226-8181

Karen Riordan
51 Trolley Road
Guilford, CT 06437

Date: July 1, 2020
Invoice: 27816
Matter: 3070
Re: Karen Riordan v. Christopher Ambrose

Fees

Date	Description	Attorney	Hours	Amount
06-01-20	Telephone calls to client (6); telephone calls with Dr. Coffey (3); review of e-mail from Bob Riordan; conference call with Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of e-mails (6); e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	2.80	2,100.00
06-02-20	Review of e-mail from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; conference call with Judge Grossman; review of e-mails from client (2); e-mail to client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; text message exchange with client	EN	1.40	1,050.00
	Telephone call to Bob Riordan; review of e-mail from Bob Riordan; telephone call to client; review of listing agreement	EN	0.50	375.00
06-03-20	Review of pendente lite stipulation of June Office conference with, 2020; conference call with Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich; e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call to client	EN	1.40	1,050.00
06-04-20	Review of e-mail from Dr. Amini; review of e-mail from client; e-mail to client; correspondence to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of e-mails re sale of house	EN	1.20	900.00

	Telephone call from client; review of e-mail from Bob Riordan; review of e-mail from client; review of e-mail from Attorney Aidan Welsh; e-mail to Attorney Aidan Welsh	EN	0.80	600.00
	Review of e-mail from client; telephone call from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz re Dr. Coffey	EN	0.20	150.00
06-05-20	Review of e-mail from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of e-mail from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of multiple e-mails from client; e-mail to client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone calls to client	EN	1.00	750.00
06-08-20	Telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of e-mail from Bob Riordan; telephone calls from client re Dr. Horwitz (4); review of e-mail from client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	1.00	750.00
	Review of e-mails (2); telephone calls from client (3)	EN	0.50	375.00
06-09-20	Telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; e-mail to client; review of e-mail from client; telephone call to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; multiple telephone calls to client	EN	0.80	600.00
	Email to Karen re preparation of financial affidavit, with enclosures: blank affidavit and generic client brief	HWH	0.20	140.00
06-10-20	Telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone call from client; review of e-mails (2); e-mail to client	EN	0.40	300.00
06-11-20	Review of Court order/copy to client; review of e-mails from client (2); review of e-mail from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; e-mail to client; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone call to client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	2.00	1,500.00
06-12-20	Telephone calls to client (2); review of e-mails from client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.60	450.00

	Review of e-mail from client; e-mails to Attorney Nancy Aldrich (3); telephone call to client	EN	0.40	300.00
06-15-20	Telephone call from Dr. Robert Horwitz; e-mail to Dr. Robert Horwitz	EN	0.30	225.00
	Telephone call to client; review of e-mail of Bob Riordan; review of e-mails; telephone call from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone call to Dr. Robert Horwitz	EN	0.70	525.00
06-16-20	Review of e-mail from client re house sale	EN	0.10	75.00
06-17-20	Review of stipulation; telephone call to client; e-mail to client; e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of e-mail from client; conference call with Attorney Nancy Aldrich, Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Dr. Robert Horwitz	EN	1.80	1,350.00
06-18-20	Telephone call from client	EN	0.20	150.00
06-19-20	Review of multiple e-mails from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of amended stipulation of Nancy Aldrich' e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz re amended stipulation; intra-office conference with Attorney Haldeman re financial affidavit; e-mail to client	EN	1.50	1,125.00
	Email from Karen attaching financial affidavit data; review and prepare first draft of affidavit	HWH	0.50	350.00
	Draft Defendant's First Request for Production; review case pleading history; prepare summary of Karen's financial affidavit filed in September, 2019, and prepare summary of data; prepare draft of new financial affidavit; email all to Karen for review	HWH	0.50	350.00
06-22-20	E-mail to client; e-mails to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz (2); review of e-mails from client; review of e-mail from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of exchanges of e-mails; e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.70	525.00
	Telephone call from client; review of 9/27/19 financial affidavit of client; telephone call to client;	EN	1.00	750.00

	intra-office conference with Attorney Haldeman; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich			
	Review of e-mail from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	0.20	150.00
	Inventory, assemble, review financial discovery documents forwarded from Atty. Callahan's office	HWH	0.90	630.00
	Intra-office e-mail to Attorney Haldeman; e-file request for approval of temporary agreement without court appearance and stipulation, pendente lite, re refraining from scheduling additional hearing dates; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; e-mail to client	MLL	0.60	165.00
06-23-20	Memo to file; e-mail to Dr. Horwitz; telephone calls to client (2); review of stipulation; e-mails to Attorney Nancy Aldrich (2); telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	1.00	750.00
	Prepare Case Notebook; inventory, review, assemble financial data documents; prepare income study from tax returns; email to Karen forwarding husband's financial data; email to Atty. Aldrich re need for 2020 financial documents from husband	HWH	1.70	1,190.00
06-24-20	Review of e-mail from client; telephone call to client re Dr. Horwitz	EN	0.50	375.00
	Telephone call from client	EN	0.30	225.00
	E-file request for approval of temporary agreement without court appearance and stipulation, pendente lite, re supervised phone contact; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; e-mail to client	MLL	0.40	110.00
06-25-20	Intra-office conference with Attorney Haldeman re disclosure and production; review of e-mails from client; telephone call to client; telephone call from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	0.60	450.00
	Research and Draft Defendant's First Request for	HWH	1.70	1,190.00

	Production; transcript Jan 27th Stipulation re data from laptops; email to Karen re review of both			
06-26-20	Review of e-mail from client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone calls to/from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone call to client	EN	0.60	450.00
	E-mail to counsel re stipulation; telephone calls to client (2); review of e-mail of 6/25/20 from Dr. Horwitz	EN	0.60	450.00
06-29-20	Emails (2) from Karen; redraft and serve Defendant's Request for Production; email to Karen; catalog joint bank accounts 2016	HWH	1.60	1,120.00
	Catalog joint bank accounts 2017 and Husband's Fidelity Accounts 2016-2017	HWH	1.10	770.00
06-30-20	Telephone call from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	0.20	150.00

Total Fees	34.50	\$24,990.00
------------	-------	-------------

Total Fees and Disbursements this billing period	\$24,990.00
--------------------------------------------------	-------------

Balance Forward at beginning of billing period	\$35,762.50
------------------------------------------------	-------------

<i>Less: Payments received during this billing period to date of this invoice</i>	<i>\$28,600.00</i>
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------	--------------------

Interest Accrued on Past Due Amounts	\$0.00
--------------------------------------	--------

<i>Less: Paid from your Retainer Account</i>	<i>\$0.00</i>
----------------------------------------------	---------------

Total Amount Due for this billing period	\$32,152.50
-------------------------------------------------	--------------------

Amount Remaining in your Client Retainer Account	\$0.00
--------------------------------------------------	--------

Law Offices of Edward Nusbaum P.C.

212 Post Road West
Westport, CT 06880-3239
(203)226-8181

Karen Riordan
51 Trolley Road
Guilford, CT 06437

Date: August 3, 2020
Invoice: 27854
Matter: 3070
Re: Karen Riordan v. Christopher Ambrose

Fees

Date	Description	Attorney	Hours	Amount
07-01-20	Review of e-mail telephone call to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.20	150.00
07-02-20	Multiple e-mails to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz, Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Dr. Robert Horwitz; review of e-mails from client re OFW (3); telephone call from Michelle	EN	1.80	1,350.00
	Telephone call to client; telephone calls from client (2); review of e-mails (8); review of e-mail from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; e-mails to client (2)	EN	0.80	600.00
	Email from Karen and response re telephone records	HWH	0.10	70.00
07-06-20	Correspondence to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; correspondence to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of e-mails (4); e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz, Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Dr. Robert Horwitz	EN	0.80	600.00
	E-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; e-mails to/from Sarah Mucci/paralegal to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; text message exchange with client; review of e-mails from client (2)	EN	0.50	375.00

07-07-20	E-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz, Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Dr. Robert Horwitz; review of e-mail from Michelle; e-mail to client	EN	0.40	300.00
	Review of multiple e-mails from client; telephone call to client	EN	0.30	225.00
07-08-20	Telephone call to client; review of e-mail from client; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone calls from client; review of e-mails from client (2); e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.80	600.00
07-09-20	Review of text message from Michelle; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich, Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Dr. Robert Horwitz	EN	0.20	150.00
	Review of e-mails (5); telephone calls from Stacy and Karen's Aunt Denise	EN	0.60	450.00
	Text message exchange with Michelle; text message exchange with client	EN	0.30	225.00
07-10-20	E-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich, Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Dr. Robert Horwitz	EN	0.20	150.00
	Telephone call from Michelle; respond to Michelle's text messages (2); review of article on parental alienation from client; e-mail to client	EN	0.60	450.00
07-13-20	E-mail to client; review of e-mail re bio of Karen Woodall	EN	0.10	75.00
	Telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone call to client	EN	0.30	225.00
07-14-20	E-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich, Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Dr. Robert Horwitz; telephone calls with Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz (2); telephone call to client	EN	0.40	300.00
	Telephone call from client	EN	0.20	150.00
07-15-20	Review of e-mails (3); telephone call from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	0.50	375.00

07-16-20	E-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; conference with client; review of e-mails (4)	EN	2.50	1,875.00
	Review of e-mail from client; telephone call from Michelle; telephone calls to client	EN	0.40	300.00
07-17-20	Telephone call from Michelle; review of e-mail from client; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of e-mail of Michelle	EN	0.40	300.00
07-20-20	Review of e-mail from client; telephone call from Michelle; e-mail to client; e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; text message exchange with Michelle	EN	0.60	450.00
	Review of e-mails and "letter" re GALs; text message exchange with Michelle	EN	0.30	225.00
07-21-20	Telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone call with client	EN	0.30	225.00
	Telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone call to client	EN	0.30	225.00
07-22-20	Review of e-mail from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review e-mails from client; telephone calls to/from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	0.30	225.00
07-23-20	Intra-office conference with Attorney Haldeman re financial affidavit of client; telephone call from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call to client; confirmation of status conference with Judge Grossman's Clerk, Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; e-mail to client	EN	1.50	1,125.00
07-24-20	Review of e-mails from client; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; e-mails to client (7); review of court notice	EN	0.60	450.00
	Telephone call from client	EN	0.10	75.00
	Email from Karen; email to Atty. Aldrich re financial data Karen needs to complete financial affidavit	HWH	0.00	0.00
07-27-20	Review of multiple correspondence from client;	EN	0.40	300.00

	e-mail to client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz			
	Telephone call from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of e-mail from client; e-mail to client	EN	0.40	300.00
07-28-20	E-mail to client; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.30	225.00
	Review of e-mail from client; telephone call from client; e-mail from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; telephone call with Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call from Bob Riordan	EN	1.20	900.00
07-29-20	Telephone call from Bob Riordan; e-mail to client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call to client; review of e-mails from client (2); conference call with Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	1.50	1,125.00
	E-mail to client; review of e-mails from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz (2); review of -mails from client	EN	0.40	300.00
07-30-20	Review of e-mails from client (3); e-mails to client (3); e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of e-mails from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of Lisa Kerin supervisor protocol	EN	0.70	525.00
	E-mail to client; review of e-mails from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of multiple e-mails from client	EN	0.30	225.00
	Telephone calls to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz (2); review of e-mails from client (3); telephone calls to/from client (6)	EN	0.80	600.00
07-31-20	E-mail to Dr. Linda Smith; review of multiple e-mails from client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.60	450.00
	Telephone call from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; review of multiple e-mails from client and Bob Riordan; e-mail to client; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; e-mail to Lisa Kerin/supervisor; review of text message from Michelle and respond	EN	1.10	825.00

	Total Fees	24.10	\$18,070.00
--	------------	-------	-------------

Disbursements

Date	Description	Amount
07-15-20	Expense Recovery Photocopies of reports of Linda Smith (therapist)/206 copies @ \$.25/copy	51.50

	Total Disbursements	\$51.50
--	---------------------	---------

Total Fees and Disbursements this billing period	\$18,121.50
Balance Forward at beginning of billing period	\$32,152.50
<i>Less: Payments received during this billing period to date of this invoice</i>	<i>\$0.00</i>
Interest Accrued on Past Due Amounts	\$0.00
<i>Less: Paid from your Retainer Account</i>	<i>\$0.00</i>

	\$50,274.00
--	--------------------

Amount Remaining in your Client Retainer Account	\$0.00
--------------------------------------------------	--------

Law Offices of Edward Nusbaum P.C.

212 Post Road West
Westport, CT 06880-3239
(203)226-8181

Karen Riordan
51 Trolley Road
Guilford, CT 06437

Date: August 27, 2020
Invoice: 27867
Matter: 3070
Re: Karen Riordan v. Christopher Ambrose

Fees

Date	Description	Attorney	Hours	Amount
08-03-20	Conference call with Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz, Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Judge Grossman; review of e-mail from client; review of notice of deposition (Verizon)	EN	0.70	525.00
	Review of e-mail from client; review of Lisa Kerin's retainer agreement; e-mail to client	EN	0.50	375.00
08-04-20	Review of e-mail from client; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.30	225.00
08-07-20	Telephone call to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.20	150.00
08-10-20	Review of e-mail from client; telephone call to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.30	225.00
	Review of e-mail from Bob Riordan; telephone call to Bob Riordan; review of e-mail from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.30	225.00
08-11-20	Review of stipulation re sale; telephone calls to Bob Riordan (2); e-mails to client (2); review of e-mail from Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	1.20	900.00

	Telephone call from Bob Riordan; review of e-mails from client; e-mail to client	EN	0.80	600.00
08-12-20	E-mail to Attorney Jack Lipson, e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of multiple e-mails from client and respond to same	EN	3.00	2,250.00
	Telephone call to Bob Riordan	EN	0.20	150.00
08-13-20	E-mails to client (2); telephone calls to Attorney Nancy Aldrich (2); multiple telephone calls to Bob Riordan; review of e-mails from client (2); review of e-mail from Todd Gaek; telephone call to Attorney Jack Lipson; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	1.60	1,200.00
08-14-20	Telephone call with Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call from Bob Riordan; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; e-mail to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	0.80	600.00
08-17-20	Telephone call from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; e-mail to Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.40	300.00
08-20-20	Telephone call from Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; review of e-mail from client to husband; telephone calls from Attorney Nancy Aldrich (2)	EN	0.40	300.00
08-21-20	Telephone call from Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call from Attorney Jack Lipson; e-mails to Attorney Jack Lipson; review of e-mails from Attorney Jack Lipson	EN	0.50	375.00
	Conference call with Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz and Attorney Nancy Aldrich	EN	0.20	150.00
08-24-20	Review of e-mail from client; review of notice of status conference from Court; e-mail to client	EN	0.30	225.00
	Review of motion for contempt e-filed with the court; telephone call to Attorney Nancy Aldrich; telephone call to Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; participated in status conference call with Judge Grossman, Attorney Nancy Aldrich, and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz	EN	2.30	1,725.00

08-25-20	Status conference with Judge Grossman; telephone calls from Attorney Nancy Aldrich and Attorney Jocelyn Hurwitz; e-mail to client; review of e-mail from client	EN	1.40	1,050.00
08-26-20	Review of e-mail from client; e-mail to client; prepare for emergency hearing in Bridgeport on 8/27/20	EN	1.20	900.00
08-27-20	Attendance at emergency hearing in Bridgeport	EN	2.50	1,875.00

Total Fees			19.10	\$14,325.00
------------	--	--	-------	-------------

Total Fees and Disbursements this billing period	\$14,325.00
--------------------------------------------------	-------------

Balance Forward at beginning of billing period	\$50,274.00
------------------------------------------------	-------------

<i>Less: Payments received during this billing period to date of this invoice</i>	<i>\$0.00</i>
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------	---------------

Interest Accrued on Past Due Amounts	\$0.00
--------------------------------------	--------

<i>Less: Paid from your Retainer Account</i>	<i>\$0.00</i>
----------------------------------------------	---------------

Total Amount Due for this billing period	\$64,599.00
-------------------------------------------------	--------------------

Amount Remaining in your Client Retainer Account	\$0.00
--------------------------------------------------	--------

Law Offices of Edward Nusbaum P.C.

212 Post Road West
Westport, CT 06880-3239
(203)226-8181

Karen Riordan
51 Trolley Road
Guilford, CT 06437

Date: October 1, 2020
Invoice: 27942
Matter: 3070
Re: Karen Riordan v. Christopher Ambrose

Fees

Date	Description	Attorney	Hours	Amount
08-28-20	Email to Atty Cunha; prepare electronic case files for delivery per her request	HWH	0.30	210.00

Total Fees	0.30	\$210.00
------------	------	----------

Total Fees and Disbursements this billing period \$210.00

Balance Forward at beginning of billing period \$64,599.00

Less: Payments received during this billing period to date of this invoice \$0.00

Interest Accrued on Past Due Amounts \$0.00

Less: Paid from your Retainer Account \$0.00

Total Amount Due for this billing period \$64,809.00

Amount Remaining in your Client Retainer Account \$0.00