Mary Piscatelli Brigham Attorney at Law 39 Sherman Hill Road Woodbury, CT 06798

> September 06, 2017 Invoice #2000005

Invoice submitted to:

Kelly Grohs 11 Longview Avenue Watertown, CT 06795

RE: Grohs vs. Grohs Post Judgment Matters

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

Your responsibility of the split charges

		Hrs/Rate	Amount
7/28/2017 MPB	Telephone call Bill Grohs	0.10	35.00
		350.00/hr	
7/26/2017 MPB	Review of Family Relations Report	0.60	210.00
		350.00/hr	
8/7/2017 MPB	Review of Blog Posts	0.20	70.00
		350.00/hr	
8/8/2017 MPB	Telephone call William Grohs	0.40	140.00
0/05/00/17 1455		350.00/hr	
8/25/2017 MPB	Telephone calls with Bill Grohs and Chris Haddad	0.40	140.00
0/00/0047 MDD	M. C. San	350.00/hr	
8/29/2017 MPB	Meeting with wards.	1.00	350.00
0/04/0047 MDD	December for Torolly 0.48	350.00/hr	
8/31/2017 MPB	Preparation for, Travel to & Attendance at Court.	5.10	1,785.00
	Telephone call Family Relations Re: Supervised Visits Email to Parties	350.00/hr	
MPB		0.00	040.00
IVIFD	Meeting with wards and Bill Grohs	0.60	210.00
7/31/2017 MPB	Telephone call Atty Facano Po: Emergency Mation Date	350.00/hr	70.00
7/31/2017 WIF D	Telephone call Atty Fasano Re: Emergency Motion Date Review of emergency motion	0.20	70.00
7/24/2017 MPB	Attention to emails	350.00/hr 0.20	70.00
7/24/2017 WII D	Attention to emails	350.00/hr	70.00
7/25/2017 MPB	Preparation for, travel to and attendance at Status Conference.	3.20	1 120 00
TIZOTZO TI WII D	reparation for, traver to and attendance at Status Conference.	350.00/hr	1,120.00
	-		
Legal Fees:		12.00	\$4,200.00
Your portion of fees:		2.40	\$840.00
Previous balance			\$2,970.81
		0-20	
Bal		\$3,810.81	
Dui			ψυ,010.01

The Law Office of Mary Piscatelli Brigham provides legal services in the areas of general litigation, including personal injury, medical malpractice, divorces and employment law. MasterCard and Visa accepted.

Kelly Grohs				Pag&
Client Split bill information Kelly Grohs				Total \$840.00
WILLIAM J. GROHS			80.00%	\$3,360.00
Currer 840.0			90 Days 560.00	120 Days 1,286.01